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KAREN BERGEY Karen is the lead editor for Encounter. Karen lives in Penn-
sylvania with her husband Blaine, the Finance Director at SU USA, and their 
two children. After homeschooling both children through middle school, Kar-
en just completed a certification in Spiritual Direction and is currently serving 
as Interim Minister of Visitation and Care at Salford Mennonite Church, her 
home congregation.

PETER MORDEN is Senior Pastor of Cornerstone Baptist Church, Leeds, UK 
and Distinguished Visiting Scholar, Spurgeon’s College, London.

CSILLA SAYSELL formerly lectured in Old Testament at Carey Baptist Col-
lege, Aukland, New Zealand. She gave up her job to do more church-facing 
teaching in a freelance capacity. She also writes Bible-reading notes (for lay 
Christians) on her blog (labradoritemoments.com). She is married to Phil and 
together they love to travel and explore new places.

PAUL WOODBRIDGE taught New Testament at Oak Hill College, London, for 
30 years. Now retired, living in Ely, UK, with his wife, Sarah, he has four sons 
and two granddaughters in London.

ERNEST LUCAS was a research biochemist before studying theology, and has 
doctorates in both disciplines. Now retired, he pastored churches in Durham 
and Liverpool, UK, and taught Biblical Studies at Bristol Baptist College, 
where he was Vice-Principal. He has written commentaries on several Old 
Testament books.

MICHAEL QUICKE is Emeritus Professor of Preaching at Northern Seminary, 
Lisle, Illinois, a Baptist minister and former principal of Spurgeon’s College. 
He is also an award-winning author and international speaker.

JOHN GRAYSTON is now retired after 37 years on the Scripture Union Eng-
land and Wales staff, but still writes, teaches, and preaches. He is on the lead-
ership team at Tile Kiln Church in Chelmsford, UK. When he can he escapes 
to his allotment, or to the mountains walking or skiing with his wife Jenny. He 
has two children and seven grandchildren.
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